Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender
Tender Summary - RFT4-2020 - Ready Mix Concrete

This Price Summary is not an Indication of Selected Bidder

Dufferin Concrete Cor:r::trirtecg:onc;ﬁcts Lafarge Canada Inc. Tow N Go Concrete Ltd.
Class of Concrete CSA Exposure Class - per Cubic Metre
20 Mpa Concrete $122.00 $155.00 $145.00 $220.00
C-4, 25 Mpa-Concrete $140.00 $165.00 $150.00 $230.00
C-3, 30 Mpa-Concrete $141.00 $175.00 $151.00 $230.00
C-2, 32 Mpa-Concrete $153.00 $183.00 $163.00 $230.00
C-1, 35 Mpa-concrete $171.00 $190.00 $181.00 $240.00
Unshrinkable Fill $105.00 $125.00 $120.00 N/A
Additional Charges - per Cubic Metre (H.S.T. Extra)
1% Calcium Chloride $7.00 $7.00 $7.50 No Bid
Enviromental Charge $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $0
Winter Heating $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 No Bid
2% Calcium Chloride $10.00 $10.00 $10.50 No Bid
Heated Water $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 No Bid
Summer Cooling $80.00 $70.00 $85.00 No Bid
Heated Water & Aggregrates $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 No Bid
Accelerated Strength $46.00 $50.00 $50.00 No Bid
Fuel Surcharge $2.00 $3.00 $2.00 $0
Federal Carbon Tax $1.50 $2.00 $1.40 $0
Conveyor Charges
40' Length $200.00 $250.00 $250.00 No Bid
40' Length $275.00 $300.00 $250.00 No Bid
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Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender
Tender Summary - RFT4-2020 - Ready Mix Concrete

Dufferin Concrete

Inter County
Concrete Products

Lafarge Canada Inc.

Tow N Go Concrete Ltd.

Underload Charges - per load (H.S.T. extra)

less than 2 m3 $300.00 $200.00 $185.00 $0
3m3---2m3 $200.00 $200.00 $185.00 $0
4m3----3m3 $200.00 $200.00 $150.00 $0
5m3----4m3 $100.00 No Bid $150.00 $0
Regular Delivery Time 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. | 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. [ 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
Winter Heating Charge to apply Nov. 1/20 to Apr. 15/21|Nov. 1/20 to Apr. 15/21|Nov. 1/20 to Apr. 15/21 N/A
Summer Cooling Charge to apply 25° 25° and above On Request N/A
Waiting Time to begin On arrival On arrival after 60 mins. On arrival
Grace time after arrival on job site 0 None 0 30 mins.
Charge following Grace Time per min $5.00 $5.00 N/A $0
Unloading Time
Unload: Time Allowed Minutes 60 60 60 60
Additional unloading charge per ea. 15 mins. $75.00 $75.00 $120.00 $0
Overtime Charges - per cubic metre
4:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m. $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $0
8:00 p.m. to midnight $60.00 $60.00 $40.00 $0
midnight to 8:00 a.m. $60.00 $60.00 $40.00 $0

Saturday Delivery -

$20/cubic metre; Plant
Other Start-up Charge

$5,000/0pening -

Additional charges att.
Plant Location (1) Niagara Falls Dunville Niagara Falls Welland
Plant Location (2) Beamsville None Niagara Falls Niagara-on-the-Lake
Terms of Payment Net 30 days Net 30 days

All Year Jan. 1/20 - Dec. 31/20 All Year

Plant Open During Year
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