

**Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender**  
**Tender Summary - RFT2-2020 - Asphalt Products**  
*This Price Summary is not an indication of Selected Bidder*

	Brennan Paving Ltd.	Coco Paving Inc.	Innovative Surface Solutions Canada	Rankin Construction Inc.	Walker Aggregates Inc.
<b>Section A: Bituminous Patching Material per Tonne</b>					
HL2	\$95.00	\$97.00	No Bid	\$86.73	No Bid
HL2A	\$95.00	\$97.00	No Bid	\$87.73	No Bid
HL3	\$76.00	\$74.00	No Bid	\$66.68	\$73.16
HL3A	\$83.00	\$76.00	No Bid	\$71.57	\$84.88
HL3C	\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.57	No Bid
HL3F	\$83.00	\$76.00	No Bid	\$71.57	\$84.88
HL3HS	\$78.00	\$76.00	No Bid	\$73.40	\$76.03
HL4	No Bid	\$76.00	No Bid	\$66.68	No Bid
HL8	\$73.00	\$72.00	No Bid	\$66.05	\$71.16
HL8HS	\$76.00	\$74.00	No Bid	\$72.77	\$75.00
HM3	\$83.00	\$97.00	No Bid	\$86.43	\$100.00
Sheet Top	\$98.00	\$97.00	No Bid	\$87.73	\$105.74
Del/Tonne for Section A	No Bid	\$13.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
Environmental Charge For Section A	\$1.25	\$1.50	No Bid	\$1.25	\$1.25
Federal Carbon Tax	\$1.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.60	\$0.06
Winter Heating	\$3.00	\$5.00	No Bid	\$2.50	\$2.35
Time when Winter Heating Applies	Nov. 1/20 to Dec. 31/20	Oct. 1/20 to Dec. 31/20	No Bid	Nov. 2/20 to Dec. 23/20	Nov. 15/20 to Dec. 31/20
<b>Section B: Asphalt Emulsion CRSI</b>					
Asphalt Emulsion CRSI Per Litre	No Bid	\$2.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.50
Total A.E CRSI	No Bid	\$6,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,500.00
Environmental Charge For Section B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.25
<b>Section C: Emulsified Asphalt Patching Materials</b>					
Premium QPR. Per Tonne	No Bid	\$117.00	\$105.00	No Bid	\$135.00
Total QPR.	No Bid	\$140,400.00	\$126,000.00	No Bid	\$162,000.00
Standard E.H.P Per Tonne	No Bid	\$117.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$135.00
Total E.H.P.	No Bid	\$140,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$162,000.00

**Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender**  
**Tender Summary - RFT2-2020 - Asphalt Products**

	Brennan Paving Ltd.	Coco Paving Inc.	Innovative Surface Solutions Canada	Rankin Construction Inc.	Walker Aggregates Inc.
Del/Tonne Section C	No Bid	\$12.00	\$18.45	No Bid	N/A
Environmental Charge For Section C	No Bid	\$1.50	None	No Bid	\$1.25
Plant Open Section A & B	No Bid	Apr. 2020 to Dec. 20, 2020	N/A	May 1/20 to Dec. 23/20	Early Apr. 2020 to late Dec. 2020
Plant Open All Year Section C	No Bid	Yes: Plant #2 and No: Plant #1	Yes	N/A	Yes

Plant Locations	Wainfleet	St. Catharines/Hamilton	St. Jacobs/Uxbridge	Thorold	Thorold/Vineland
Payment Terms	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Monthly	Net 30