

Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender RFT3-2019 N.P.P.C. Tender Summary - Granular Materials.

This Price Summary is not an Indication of Selected Bidder

		Walker Aggregates	Port Colborne Quarries	Law Crushed Stone	St. Amands Landscape Depot Inc.
Section A	Definition and Specifications	Unit Price Per Tonne	Unit Price Per Tonne	Unit Price Per Tonne	Unit Price Per Yard
1	5/8" Granular Class "A" (Spec -OPSS 1010)	\$12.50	\$11.10	\$10.00	\$33.00
2	7/8" Granular Class "A" (Spec - OPSS 1010)	\$12.30	\$10.85	\$9.80	\$33.00
3	Granular Class "M" (Spec - OPSS 1010)	\$12.50	\$11.10	\$10.00	\$33.00
4	Granular Class "A" (Spec - OPSS 1010) 3/4" T.B	\$12.30	\$10.85	\$9.80	\$33.00
5	Granular "B" (Spec -OPSS 1010)	\$12.30	\$10.40	\$9.60	No Bid
6	3/4" Clear Stone	\$17.50	\$15.50	\$14.80	\$38.50
7	2" Clear Stone	\$17.50	\$15.25	\$14.80	No Bid
8	1/2" Crushed Rock Stone (Crusher Run)	\$12.50	\$11.10	\$10.00	No Bid
9	3/4" Crushed Rock Stone (Crusher Run)	\$12.30	\$10.85	\$10.00	No Bid
10	2" Crushed Rock Stone (Crusher Run)	\$12.30	\$10.60	\$9.60	No Bid
11	Rip Rap/Gabion Stone	\$20.70	\$15.65	\$20.50	No Bid
12	Limestone Screenings (1/4 Minus)	\$11.90	\$11.35	\$11.00	\$34.00
13	1/2" Traffic Bond	\$12.50	\$11.10	\$10.50	\$33.00
14	Delivery Charges (if applicable) to other than Section B Locations	Zone Rate per Tonne	N/A	N/A	Call For Price
15	Environmental Fee- per Tonne (included in prices)	\$1.25	\$1.35	\$1.50	No Bid
16&17	Ministry of Natural Resources Fee to be stated separately on invoices:	Yes	Yes	Yes	No
	Note: MNR Fee Per Tonne	\$0.202	\$0.198	\$0.202	No Bid
Section B	Delivery Location				
A1	City of Niagara Falls - Zone 1 Price Per Tonne	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$5.80	\$5.70	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
A2	City of Niagara Falls - Zone 2 Price Per Tonne	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$5.30	\$5.20	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
B	Town of Fort Erie	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$5.30	\$5.20	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
C	Niagara Parks Commision	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$5.40	\$5.35	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
D	City of St. Catharines	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$5.80	\$6.00	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
E	City of Welland	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$4.30	\$3.90	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
F	City of Port Colborne	Zone Rate per Tonne	\$4.00	\$2.50	Call for Pricing
	Minimum Order for Deilvery (Tonnes)	18 Tonnes	20 Tonnes	35 Tonnes	Call for Pricing
	Location of Quarry				
		Thorold, ON	Port Colborne, ON	Wainfleet, ON	St. Catharines, ON