

RFT2-2019 N.P.P.C Tender Summary Asphalt Products

This Price Summary is not an indication of Selected Bidder

	Coco Paving Inc.	Walker Aggregates Inc.	Rankin Construction Inc.	Brennan Paving Ltd.	Innovative Surface Solutions Canada	Lakeside Landscape Inc.
Section A: Bituminous Patching Material per Tonne						
HL2	\$83.00	\$97.67	\$96.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HL2A	\$83.00	\$97.67	\$97.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HL3	\$73.50	\$70.79	\$71.34	\$74.00	No Bid	No Bid
HL3A	\$75.50	\$81.76	\$77.89	\$81.00	No Bid	No Bid
HL3C	n/a	\$84.26	\$77.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HL3HS (High Stability)	\$77.50	\$76.38	\$73.34	\$77.00	No Bid	No Bid
HL4	N/A	\$76.38	\$71.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HL8	\$71.50	\$68.79	\$71.34	\$72.00	No Bid	No Bid
Sheet Top	\$85.00	\$102.39	\$97.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Del/Tonne for Section A	\$13.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Environ Charge For Section A	\$1.50	\$1.25	\$1.00	\$1.00	No Bid	No Bid
Winter Heating	\$5.00	\$2.35	\$2.50	\$3.00	No Bid	No Bid
Time when Winter Heating Applies	Oct. 1 - Dec 31, 2019	Nov. 15 - Dec. 31, 2019	Nov. 1 - Dec. 23, 2019	Nov. 1 - Dec. 31, 2019	No Bid	No Bid
Section B: Bituminous Patching Material per Tonne						
Asphalt Emulsion CRSI Per Litre	\$2.15	\$2.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total A.E CRSI	\$6,450.00	\$7,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Environ Charge For Section B	\$0.00	\$1.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section C: Emulsified Asphalt Patching Materials						
Premium QPR. Per Tonne	\$116.00	\$135.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$105.00	\$218.50
Total QPR.	\$23,200.00	\$27,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$21,000.00	\$43,700.00
Standard E.H.P Per Tonne	\$116.00	\$135.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total E.H.P.	\$23,200.00	\$27,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Del/Tonne Section C	\$1.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.50	\$5.95
Env.Charge Section C	\$10.00	\$1.25	No Bid	No Bid	None	No Bid
Plant Open Section. A & B	Apr. 1 - Dec. 31, 2019	Early Apr. - Late Dec. 2019	May 1 - Dec. 22, 2019	May 1 - Dec. 31, 2019	N/A	N/A
Plant Open All Year Section C	Location 2	Yes	No	No	Yes	Yes
Plant Locations	St. Catharines/Hamilton	Thorold/Vineland	Thorold, ON	Wainfleet, ON	St. Jacobs & Uxbridge, ON	Thorold ,ON